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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



ভূিমকা
বাংলা at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



ভূিমকা
বাংলা at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Cebuano at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Cebuano at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Chichewa at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Asaang Khongca at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



前言
漢語 at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



前言
汉语 at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



前言
漢語 at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Matupi Chin at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Matupi Chin at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Chongthu at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Thai Phum at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Predgovor
Hrvatski at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Předmluva
Čeština at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Předmluva
Čeština at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Forord
Dansk at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Forord
Dansk at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Dholuo at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
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'ETERNITY REVISITED' A Study of the Greek Word aion and other resources at
AionianBible.org/Aionios-and-Aidios. This article is a useful introduction to the first
century usage and meaning of aion and aionios. Further resources can be found
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Again, the original text for each translation in the Aionian Bible library is unaltered,
except for this particular Bible named the Aionian Bible, which is itself a new translation
based on the World English Bible as explained above. To help parallel study and
Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most variant verse
numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at eBible.org,
Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian Bible is
copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100% freedom to
copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide and read
online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network.
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eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



��તાવના

ગુજરાતી at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Prefas
Kreyòl Ayisyen at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Prefas
Kreyòl Ayisyen at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Hausa at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



'Ōlelo Mua
Ōlelo Hawai'i at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



המדקה
תירבע at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



̼̂तावना
िह˵दी at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



̼̂तावना
िह˵दी at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
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and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



序文
日本語 at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



序文
日本語 at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



ಮುನುvë

ಕನvಡ at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



ಮುನುvë

ಕನvಡ at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



머리말
한국어 at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



머리말
한국어 at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Kusaiean at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
ᇃሏارޡݿیدرި܋ at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Praefatio
Latine at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Priekšvārds
Latviešu at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Lingála at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Preface
Luganda at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Tena Fanolorana
Malagasy at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Tena Fanolorana
Tandroy at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



ആമുഖം
മലയാളം at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
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മലയാളം at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
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ြမန်မာဘာသာ at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
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နိဒါန်း

ြမန်မာဘာသာ at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
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ြမန်မာဘာသာ at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
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Isendlalelo
Ndebele at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
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ϩȌرόɑ at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
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prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Prefácio
Língua Portuguesa at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Prefácio
Língua Portuguesa at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
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baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
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The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
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aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
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Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
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baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Предговор
Cрпски at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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chiShona at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Predgovor
Slovenščina at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Hordhac
Somali at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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Español at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Prólogo
Español at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Prólogo
Español at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



Prólogo
Español at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
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translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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தம�ழ் at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!



xன்�ைர

தம�ழ் at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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Ŵĸğ at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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Akuapem Twi at AionianBible.org/Preface

The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
godliness! And the aiōnios life promised in John 3:16 is not simply a ticket to eternal life
in the future, but the invitation through faith to the consummate life beginning now!

The next seven words are Sheol, Hadēs, Geenna, Tartaroō, Abyssos, and Limnē Pyr.
These words are often translated as Hell, the place of eternal punishment. However,
Hell is ill-defined when compared with the Hebrew and Greek. For example, Sheol is
the abode of deceased believers and unbelievers and should never be translated as
Hell. Hadēs is a temporary place of punishment, Revelation 20:13-14. Geenna is the
Valley of Hinnom, Jerusalem's refuse dump, a temporal judgment for sin. Tartaroō is a
prison for demons, mentioned once in 2 Peter 2:4. Abyssos is a temporary prison for
the Beast and Satan. Translators are also inconsistent because Hell is used by the
King James Version 54 times, the New International Version 14 times, and the World
English Bible zero times. Finally, Limnē Pyr is the Lake of Fire, yet Matthew 25:41
explains that these fires are prepared for the Devil and his angels. So there is reason to
review our conclusions about the destinies of redeemed mankind and fallen angels.

The eleventh word, eleēsē, reveals the grand conclusion of grace in Romans 11:32.
Take the time to understand these eleven words. The original translation is unaltered
and a note is added to 64 Old Testament and 200 New Testament verses. To help
parallel study and Strong's Concordance use, apocryphal text is removed and most
variant verse numbering is mapped to the English standard. We thank our sources at
eBible.org, Crosswire.org, unbound.Biola.edu, Bible4u.net, and NHEB.net. The Aionian
Bible is copyrighted with creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nd/4.0, allowing 100%
freedom to copy and print, if respecting source copyrights. Check the Reader's Guide
and read online at AionianBible.org, with Android, and TOR network. Why purple? King
Jesus’ Word is royal… and purple is the color of royalty!
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The Holy Bible Aionian Edition ® is the world’s first Bible un-translation! What is an un-
translation? Bibles are translated into each of our languages from the original Hebrew,
Aramaic, and Koine Greek. Occasionally, the best word translation cannot be found and
these words are transliterated letter by letter. Four well known transliterations are Christ,
baptism, angel, and apostle. The meaning is then preserved more accurately through
context and a dictionary. The Aionian Bible un-translates and instead transliterates
eleven additional Aionian Glossary words to help us better understand God’s love for
individuals and all mankind, and the nature of afterlife destinies.

The first three words are aiōn, aiōnios, and aïdios, typically translated as eternal
and also world or eon. The Aionian Bible is named after an alternative spelling of
aiōnios. Consider that researchers question if aiōn and aiōnios actually mean eternal.
Translating aiōn as eternal in Matthew 28:20 makes no sense, as all agree. The Greek
word for eternal is aïdios, used in Romans 1:20 about God and in Jude 6 about demon
imprisonment. Yet what about aiōnios in John 3:16? Certainly we do not question
whether salvation is eternal! However, aiōnios means something much more wonderful
than infinite time! Ancient Greeks used aiōn to mean eon or age. They also used the
adjective aiōnios to mean entirety, such as complete or even consummate, but never
infinite time. Read Dr. Heleen Keizer and Ramelli and Konstan for proofs. So aiōnios
is the perfect description of God's Word which has everything we need for life and
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